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Design/Methods: A school-based smoking survey was 
conducted on 45857 secondary 1-6 (US Grade 7-12) stu-
dents (response rate 96%) from 75 randomly selected 
secondary schools in Hong Kong in 2013/13. A total of 
1768 (3.9%) current smokers (occasional or daily) were 
included in the present analysis. E-cigarette use in the past 
30 days, intention to quit smoking (cigarette), and quit 
attempts in the past 12 months were recorded. Smoking 
or wanting to smoke first thing in the morning (morning 
smoking), and consuming more cigarettes (heavier smok-
ing) indicated higher level of nicotine addiction. Logistic 
and linear regressions were used to calculate the odds ra-
tios (AOR) of intention to quit, quit attempt and morning 
smoking, and adjusted β-coefficient of cigarette consump-
tion with e-cigarette use, adjusting for socio-demographic 
characteristics, parental and peer smoking, and school 
clustering effects. 

Results: On average, the smokers consumed 17.2 (SD 
11.1) cigarettes/month and nearly half (48.4%) reported 
morning smoking. Over half the smokers reported an 
intention to quit (50.7%) and quit attempts (59.3%). 
About 10% current smokers used e-cigarette in the past 
30 days. Compared with conventional cigarette use only, 
e-cigarette use was significantly associated with morning 
smoking (72.1% vs 46.1%, p <0.01) and heavier smoking 
(19.4 vs17.0 cigarettes/month, p<0.01) with an AOR (95% 
CI) of 2.16 (1.50-3.11) for morning smoking and adjusted 
β-coefficient of 0.16 (0.09-0.24) for heavier smoking. In 
contrast, e-cigarette use was non-significantly associated 
with lower intention to quit (AOR 0.75, 95% CI 0.52-1.09) 
and fewer quit attempts (AOR 0.80, 95% CI 0.56-1.13). 

Conclusion: E-cigarettes use was significantly associated 
with nicotine addiction and might be negatively associ-
ated with quitting in adolescent smokers. These results 
highlight the need to examine potential adverse effects of 
adolescent e-cigarette use.
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Background: There is an ongoing debate on using Elec-
tronic cigarettes (E-cig) as an alternative to reduce harms 
or assist in smoking cessation. Currently, the use of E-cig 
in Hong Kong adults is extremely low because sale of nic-
otine-loaded E-cig is restricted by law. We investigated the 
prevalence of awareness, perceived harmfulness of E-cig 
and their associations with smokers’ intention to quit. 

Design/Methods: A population-based computer-assisted 
telephone survey was conducted in 2013 in 2401 randomly 
selected Chinese respondents aged 15 to 65. Information 
on awareness and perceived harmfulness of E-cig was col-
lected in a randomly-selected subsample of 697 respon-
dents. Intention to quit in the next 6 months was asked in 
current smokers. Using logistic regression models adjust-
ing for demographic variables and nicotine dependency 
(including daily consumption and first cigarette in the 
morning), associations of intention to quit with awareness 
and perceived harmfulness of E-cig were examined. Data 
were weighted by sex, age and smoking status using census 
data in 2013 to compensate for oversampling of current 
and ex-smokers and to increase the representativeness to 
the general population. 

Results: Most respondents (66.1%, 95%CI: 60.4-71.4%) 
were aware of E-cig with 75.0% (95%CI: 68.0-80.9%) 
of current smokers, 68.7% of ex-smokers (95%CI: 59.1-
76.8%) and 64.8% of never smokers (95%CI: 58.0-71.0%) 
(p=0.06). Of those who were aware of E-cig, 39.2% 
(95%CI: 31.3-47.8%) believed it was less harmful than 
traditional cigarettes while 46.1% (95%CI 38.3-54.1%) 
did not know whether E-cig was less, equal or more harm-
ful. Awareness (OR=1.1, 95%CI: 0.3-3.9, p=0.90) and 
perceived E-cig as less harmful (OR=0.9, 95%CI: 0.2-5.1, 
p=0.89) were not associated with intention to quit in the 
next 6 months in smokers.  

Conclusion: The majority of Hong Kong people were 
aware of E-cig and more than one third believed it was 
less harmful than traditional cigarettes. However, in cur-
rent smokers the awareness and perceived harm was not 
associated with intent to quit. Further studies are needed 
to investigate these associations. 
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Background and challenges to implementation: Argen-
tina in 2003 signed the FCTC while the Ministry of Health 
launched the National Tobacco Control Program. Start-
ing from a situation with very high levels of consumption 
and exposure to second-hand smoke, for 10 years the pro-
gram has developed strategies to face resistance from the 
tobacco industry, the sectors producing tobacco and other 
stakeholders. The aim of the study was to analyse the pro-
cess of construction and implementation of control policy 
tobacco in Argentina and the factors that influenced its 
development and results. 




